
 22 

 

The Bedford Prize for the best paper published 
in The Annals of Occupational Hygiene during 
2011-2013 has been won by the authors of a 
paper assessing the success of a campaign 
initiated by the Health and Safety Executive 
(HSE) to reduce occupational asthma caused by 
isocyanates, published in February 2013.  The 
paper was ‘Isocyanate exposure control in 
motor vehicle paint spraying: evidence from 
biological monitoring’ by Kate Jones, John 
Cocker and Mark Piney (Annals of Occupational 
Hygiene, 2013, 57(2):200-209) and can be 
accessed on the Annals website free of charge 
http://annhyg.oxfordjournals.org/
content/57/2/200.full.pdf+html.  
 
The paper underscores the importance of using 
scientifically robust methods to evaluate and 
document the effectiveness of programs 
designed to reduce exposures and risk.  Such 
‘intervention research’ studies are among the 
priorities of the Annals for publication. 
Isocyanates are the leading cause of 
occupational asthma in the UK, with spray 
painters in the motor vehicle repair (MVR) 
industry at greatest risk.  The HSE initiated a 
programme of Safety and Health Awareness 
Days (SHADs) to highlight how occupational 
asthma was preventable through a series of 
simple, practical control measures.  The paper 
described the use of biological monitoring to 
assess isocyanate exposures during and after 
the SHADs. 
 
Initial research by the HSE found that 
employers, spray painters and industry 
suppliers alike failed to appreciate the key 
hazards to health; the high concentrations of 
isocyanates in the fine mist created during 
spraying, the importance of clearance times in 
spray booths, and the danger of exposure 
when respiratory protective equipment was 
removed before the room/booth had cleared. 
To improve understanding and awareness key 
stakeholders across the industry were invited 
to attend SHADs where speakers provided 
evidence of the harm caused by isocyanates, 

how exposure could occur, ways in which to 
control exposure, and simple ways to check 
controls were working effectively.  The study 
found that ‘eighteen percent of UK body shops 
attended a SHAD and 90% of attendees 
intended to take some action to improve their 
control of exposure’ (O’Hara, 2006a), while 
some of the key messages, such as clearance 
times in spray booths, had been widely 
adopted across the majority of UK bodyshops 
(Broughton et al, 2010). 
 
The authors went further and used biological 
monitoring to illustrate the impact of the 
intervention on the exposure of the workforce, 
using hexamethylene diamine (HDI) in urine as 
a measure of the worker's absorption of 
hexamethylene diisocyanate (HDA).  There was 
already a lot of data available to the authors on 
HDI in paint-sprayers from HSE enforcement 
and routine sampling.  The levels in paint-
sprayers after the SHADs were substantially 
less than in the earlier data, and this 
improvement was maintained.  The effect of 
control measures could also be demonstrated.  
Where the SHAD population had measurable 
HDI in urine, this tended to decrease after 
further training. 
 
The Bedford Prize is BOHS’s oldest award, and 
is presented every two years to the authors of 
the ‘most outstanding’ paper published in the 
Annals of Occupational Hygiene during the 
relevant period.  Anyone can nominate a paper 
to the shortlist, and a panel of the Editorial 
Board and senior members of BOHS 
individually choose up to four papers and rank 
them.  Papers are given points according to the 
choice, and the winner is the paper with the 
most points. Winners receive £500 and a 
certificate, presented to the lead author at the 
Annual Conference.  This year’s winner will be 
awarded the prize at the IOHA 2015 
conference, which is being hosted by BOHS, in 
London in April 2015.  There will be an editorial 
in the Annals beforehand giving a fuller 
background to the research and the paper. 

 
Kate Jones is an analytical chemist working as a 
principal scientist in HSL’s Biological 
Monitoring team.  A Fellow of the Royal 
Society of Chemistry, she has extensive 
experience and expertise in the biological 
monitoring of organic compounds.  Kate has 
published over 50 peer-reviewed papers and 
been invited to speak at conferences in the 
Netherlands and Finland.  As an active BOHS 
member she is Regional Organiser for the East 
Midlands and Yorkshire.  Kate will be delivering 
the Thomas Bedford Memorial Prize Lecture at 
the IOHA 2015 conference.  

Dr John Cocker is a Fellow at HSL with 40 years’ 
experience in biological monitoring and over 
90 peer-reviewed publications.  He is a 
member of the ACGIH Biological Exposure 
Indices Committee and an occasional advisor 
to the World Health Organisation.  A member 
of BOHS for many years, he is an assistant 
editor for the Annals of Occupational Hygiene 
and a passionate advocate of biological 
monitoring. 
 
Dr Mark Piney is 
a highly 
experienced, 
professional 
occupational 
hygienist, and a 
former HM 
Principal 
Specialist 
Inspector with 
the HSE.  Having 
spent 22 years 
with the HSE 
doing 
investigations, 
inspections, 
audits, commissioning research and writing 
guidance, he now acts as an independent 
consultant specialising in control of substances 
hazardous to health, and compliance with the 
COSHH Regulations in large and small 
businesses.  Mark was also co-author of a 
Bedford Prize winning paper in 1986 on noise 
exposure measurement published in 1984.   
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Dedication to the prevention of occupational 
disease around the world has motivated 
occupational hygienists and other occupational 
health professionals to form the non-profit 
Workplace Health Without Borders (WHWB).   
“Even occupational health professionals may 
be surprised to learn that occupational illness 
and injury kill more people than causes that 
get a lot more attention, like armed conflict 
and HIV/AIDS,” says David Zalk, a WHWB 
Board member and past President of the 
International Occupational Hygiene Association 
(IOHA). “With occupational health hazards 
responsible for 2 million deaths and another 
160 million illnesses annually, there is a 
tremendous need that WHWB wants to help 
fill.”   
 
Only 13 countries offer professional 
certification in occupational hygiene, and it has 
been estimated that another 55,000 certified 
hygienists would be needed worldwide to offer 
the level of service available in those 13 
countries. WHWB members are willing to 
volunteer their knowledge and services to help 
fill this gap.  
 
Registered as a charity in Canada, WHWB has 
an international membership including 
members in the UK. WHWB encourages 
members to form chapters in other regions, 
and currently chapters are forming in the US, 
Australia and Africa. WHWB’s mission is to 
engage the occupational health professions in 
ensuring that workers and employers 
throughout the world have the knowledge and 

technical means to prevent work-related 
disease.  Its members include occupational 
hygienists, physicians and other health and 
safety experts who volunteer their time to 
offer training, mentoring and technical 
assistance to help develop capacity and 
knowledge to prevent occupational disease in 
areas that lack resources and expertise.   
 
WHWB is partnering with the University of 
Toronto on a project to address high silica 
exposure among agate workers in Gujarat, 
India.  The project, which received a grant from 
Canada’s Grand Challenges program, also 
involves the People’s Training and Research 

Centre (PTRC), a community organization in 
Gujarat. “Technical solutions commonly 
applied in the developed world may be very 
difficult to implement, due to lack of resources, 
energy and water,” explains Om Malik, a 
WHWB Board and project team member.  
“Another serious issue, common in many 
countries, is that children as well as adults are 
exposed to high levels of hazards like silica, 
because they work as child labourers, or their 
parents work at home or bring the children to 

work because there is no school or childcare.” 
A number of WHWB’s projects involve silica 
exposure. Other examples include WHWB’s 
work with Jeevan Rekha Parishad (JRP) in 
Orissa, India, which works to prevent silica 
exposure in the stonecrushing industry.  
WHWB is also working with groups in Pakistan, 
Nepal and Tanzania to address exposure to 
silica and other hazards in brick making plants, 
which employ many child labourers. In relation 
to the widespread interest in silica, WHWB 
volunteers are writing a silica module to be 
offered through the Occupational Hygiene 
Training Association (OHTA).  
 
WHWB is a recognized OHTA training provider, 
and plans to offer OHTA courses in areas 
where participants cannot pay the full fee for 
courses offered by private providers. Through 
the WHWB mentoring program, members 
mentor new occupational health professionals 
in developing countries through regular online 
meetings.  WHWB accepts donations of 
occupational hygiene equipment, and has 
provided equipment or facilitated direct 
donations to groups that need it.  
 
WHWB meets monthly by teleconference, and 
welcomes all those who share our goals to join 
our network and attend our meetings. We 
need more volunteer help to build the 
organization and also welcome financial and in
-kind donations to support our services. 
WHWB would welcome a UK chapter if there is 
interest in forming one.   
 
For more information, please visit our 
website,  
 
www.whwb.org,  
 
see our video  https://vimeo.com/74343804    
 
or email info@whwb.org 
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another 160 million illnesses 
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